
HIGH COURT OF MADHYA PRADESH : JABALPUR 

Endt. No 	9-°c) 	 Jabalpur, dt) 	/01/2018 
DS) 

The copy of the Gazette Notification published in M.P. 
Rajpatra 	dated 26 April, 2016 and 15 December 2017 in 
respect of "Gender Sensitisation and Sexual Harrasment of 
Women at the High Court of Madhya Pradesh and Subordinate 
Courts (Prevention, Prohibition and Redressal) Regulations, 
2015" is forwarded to 

(i)The District & Sessions Judge 	 , with a 
request to bring the same into the knowledge of all the 
Judicial Officers under their kind control, for information 
and necessary action. 

(ii) The District & Sessions Judge (Inspection & 
Vigilance), Jabalpur / Indore / Gwalior; 

(iii) The Director MPSJA for doing the needful . 

(iv) The Principal Registrar, Bench at Indore/Gwalior 
High Court of M.P., Jabalpur. 

(v) P.S. to Hon'ble the Chief Justice ,High Court of 
Madhya Pradesh 	Jabalpur for placing the matter 
before His Lordships 

(vi) P.S. to Registrar General/ Principal Registrar(JudI)/ 
Principal Registrar (Inspection & Vigilance),/ 
Principal Registrar 	(Examination) / Principal 
Registrar (ILR) High court of Madhya Pradesh 
Jabalpur, 

(vii) P.A. to Director/Additional Director/JOTRI, High 
Court of Madhya Pradesh Jabalpur, 

(viii) Registrar Admn/ (1)/(D.E.)/(A)/ (Vig.)/ (VI.)/ 
(A.W.), High 	Court of Madhya Pradesh, Jabalpur. 

(ix) The Registrar(IT) for uploading the same in NIC. 

for information & appropriate action. 

f -t) 
(SANAT KUMAR KASHYAP) 

REGISTRAR(DE) 



--.14k--41411Z www.govtpressmp.nic. in 
1-11 ZU,1*fi,fft 	cbdIt. 

TiTNWIT u 	r4)1c1 

4-0-114) 181 
	

't4tEra, 	(fliiT 29 AO 2016—URI 9, 	1ct 1938 

WTI 

(T) 	(1) Tiuurkvi railERF, 	 (2) NcR VrTifd 
	

(3) #Rq la-Tft-erfftrdf. 
(i) aTt*qi, 	 (2) 1rtzt1 3-0Tfiz1ri, 	 (3) *K 

(TT) 	( 1 ) 1,TrFti figH, 	 (2) 3Ti-- 1 

lurrrr 	)—To- 

(41RT ( )--t-U 

4TITT 	( Tr ) 

f974-44 

fartr 	fatut 44)14 ?awl.  

1129-21----4-(tch)-2016 	 '4(1M, tiiT 26 340.  2016 

Approved Draft 

THE GENDER SENSITISATION AND SEXUAL HARASSMENT OF WOMEN AT THE HIGH COURT OF 

MADHYA PRADESH AND SUBORDINATES COURTS 

(PREVENTION, PROHIBITION AND REDRESSAL) 

REGULATIONS, 2015 

361 



0
  0

1
.  J

O
 u oI s s aj oi d 

0 

CD 

1. s u
r e 2

-8  
0 

CD 

u
o
ges-pIsu

gs  s
va

?ia i-DY‘  

cp 

tr
ad
e
 o
r 

b
u

si
n

es
s
 w
h

ic
h

 in
cl

u
d

es
 

CIA 

cp 

CD 

CO 
CD 

I
s  

1
5
  o

f  
th
e
 co

n
st

i t
u

ti
o
n

 o
f I

n
d
ia

 an
d
  h

e
r r

ig
h
t 

(It) I Wit 910Z apti.' 6Z 41A4  rthka. 



%1111 4 (TO Tivz517T 71414, fq;Ti" -•  29,  3T -0' 2016 	 363 

6
6
6
-7

0
/
9

2
  

or
  in

ci
de

nt
al

 U
ni

on
  o

f 
In

di
a  

rcd 

0 

C) 

St
at

e  
o
f
 R

aj
a

st
h

an
  r

en
de

re
d
 by

  t
h

e  

a) 
cr) 

• r-4 

Co 

it
s  

S
u

b
or

d i
n

at
e  

rx1 



P

9 OZ It14L 6Z 4.,!1-',.)j   	t79 (IL) b lint ] 

th
a
t m

ay
 b

e 
fil

ed
  i
n

 th
a
t r

eg
ar

d
; 

Ci*  • 
CD 

• ti 

fsu
o -pe

p
os sy  "B

E
  p

u
e  

en
t 

in
cl

u
d
in
g
 th

e 
di

re
ct

io
n
s
 w
i t
h

 re
g 

r+ 
0 

CD CD 

r-t 0 

IJ  m
iT E

  siAl  `C
T 	

J o 

ioqn
g  p

u
e  LIs ap e id

  e
a
m

ew
  J o  

i 
CD 
t 

1OA
ajes  Q

in
s u

Q
01.  s i l o -p et  

-Im
o
°  -upT H

  a
Lp.  ei  

• 
r+ 
r+ 
CD 
CD 



 

14%21311 	ft11F 29 3T -6 2016 

 

365 

TIM 4 ( ) _ 

  

     

     

o bn r. 	 rd 
,-0 

O r" 	
• 0 rd 	• 	 CD -I-) 

0 0 rCi 	 0 	inr_i  
a)

b 	

4 

f3 	
'4  ° 0 4-1 0 N  Cl) 

4) rCl 
a) 

> al 
rd 	

qi 
w 	

rd 
cci • P-, Q 

a) • al (1)
t4 	k 
i -74 C) 	Q 	C14 I 

1-4 	
(1) 	 Cd • 	V; 

P-4 	d 	• 'cKi 	 ,r0 	4 	r__, • c‘i 

E
a) 

T) 	
r cd 	(1) 	

.N 

0 	+-, 	
d 	0 

(14 	al 	cr 

4-d 4 
'.4_.i 	

Cl) 	H 
$--4 

al 	y-  

.Co 	(.4_4 	Cl) 
	 4) 

• . 0 	 4-4 	ri) 

ai 	
'4 	CKJ 	Cl) 

Cl) 	o 
tE 

0 4C3 	r0 	
W 	a) a) (.) 

1 4 'ill 
U) 

•,-.1 0 	 f()  4 P4 ° 	
0 

o 0 

	

0 , 	 a) F-1 Ti  
i 	

(6 
• 4) 

Cl) 1-4 >4 	
a) 	a) 

Cd 	-1-i 	
(1)c.1 	

T. 
, 	

+) P.4 	
• r 

v4 	
• r-1 

	

Tf 0 0 	
o 

.r., 	
0 b.0 

a) 
d 	•(_, 4) 

(1) ' 	0 bp 	 ;.-44 	'il rr2 0 

cci 	Z 	Ci4 	4-1 	.r• 	' al 	
rn 
Cl) 

	

. P. 	Q 
,L.i 	

P4 
il 	

0 0 o U) 

1-4 	
0 	 5 	41u  --; 

_ 
Go 	tl. 
0 0 	, .;_i 

	

79 	 0 : 	
,(1) 4-3 0 r-i 0 cn- 

ed o 	o ci, 0  
r„ 	+, 	(1) 	 pi 	0 

5 H 0 
(1)  

Cd 
M 0 > 0 al 

P4 4a) 	
(/) Cl) 
	 g (i) 4)  

-4--' 	'---a 
. a) 	• r-4 	a) 	 o 	d ' 

8. 	cu 

cnro 0 bi) 0 

	

i-i 	
ml 	C/) 4,) 4c,) 0 1-4 	P4 

4.) 	ci)  
• 

g 	4-) 	 ., 	cn 

-ri5J al  4-) 
a) 

H in  al 0 

rw 	
0) 
C.) 	

a) 

	

k 	
0 
0 0 

0 
0 

0 r.8 }-, 	a) 	 4.1 	(1),_i  o • 

(I),.0 0 0 	4--• i 	
0 rd 

r  8 6 v) 
0 	 0 

< 
u 0 	k 

	

0 o o 	 ,-4 0 •,--( 	.5 
r0 	 •r4 

0 

- 0 4-) -4-)  O 	 •..4 4.) 0 
	 4) 

LT1 	
—4  

Z 	
rci 	4 	

4, cd 0  (r) 0 

(1)
• 	.-4 	g 

0 r° 
0 	. f-4 

• 4-)  
(CS 	1V4 

2,4) 

› 	,4 
(I) 

Z u 0 --I  
< 	44' 0 	', 	E-1 	

r-i 	(/) 	• r-4 



(b
)a

p
p
ro

p
ri

a
te

 A
u
th

o
ri

ty
"  

0
;  1.1 011, P

i a
l  

fL).. (----D 	u) 	o 

a 	A.) 

	

ti 1O cr 	(1 
IQ 	

- 

C 	. 	0  

P Cl 

	

-a. 	
c, 

0 4' ,. . 

	

P 	
ri- ,--.. 
0 rt 6. it 

CD 	rP' 	P 	
rt- 

	

CD 	CD 
r-t- 	ci.4  
c-,  0 CD  

fli obq 	p: 	H  
ClQ 	1""i M p 
CD  
00 	ç 0) p) (1)  

0 0 '• 

	

rt- 	CD 0 P 
a 

CD 	
tt 

(-) 	
0,, 
a co It )--i 

0 	1-1 	p 
0 in, 

	

1... 	(1)0 	P-. 

	

0 th 	CD 	CD 

	

CD rt. 	0 p (/) 

	

ill 	
w. 	. 	oa 
N-. ,li 
CD a 

011 	.CD 	P 	9
CO  
	)--, • 

CD a: ci) CA) 
0 0 

(i) 	0 0 

	

5 
g 
 2, 	0 0  

. 	
,--.., 0 
rt  

0 a, co 	r+ ... . 

	

H' 	cl, 

ro pw 

	

1-1 0 	N 	hzi 

	

p 0 	CD 	9 

	

Pai n 	P 
(1) 	PL 

	

0 r+ 	W 	n 
u4 

	

Z 	r4 

	

CD 	CD 
CE 

a: 

	

0 	rD• 	a 

Co 

	

\ w 	

1-1 r-t- 

	

PD 	--i 

	

c) 	
.,. (-t- 

	

C)  
CD 	CI 

0 

cn  

'd a 
P co0 a 
0,  P 	_ Ce -:.• P 
(J) 	rt- 	n 

• o 	
Cr. 

	

CD 	8' 0 n 
... 	co 

< a, c) 

	

rt- 	Pt-i)- 	il 
P, CD a. 

)--i n  ascr,  (/)(f)  ri6 0 
. 	0 0 

c) 	5 CD 	t< 4 0 

	

P- 04 
	01 it rn rt 

0 $1) 
73 CD  

	

0 	d 
o 

w 

	

a. P j " 	co 
O 	(Tt- CD CD r+ 	n X 

	

.. A) 	CO 
,-.,. 

.., 	
0 

0' ID  co p 0 

.. cp 	.., CD 
f---, 	WCD 

gi P P 
c) 
./.I 	ti 

	

1-1 	
R 

dr*Q 

(< g 
c 	

a 
W 

	

. 	rt- 	Cixl  

	

co 	t-t- 
0 

cy' " o o c< 	5 0 r+ 

	

CD 103 	a 

CI)(5t- 'dCDP co 	a 	R,  

c) a 0 
CD 0 ici P I.  

	

0 	CD 5" 	it )--i P 
CI' r+ rt P 0,  
o e 0 0 n 

, 4 
o 

CD CD 

	

A) 	04  
t o 0 	)-I 0 o 

C) 	0 
at 0 	CD 	H 

P-1 	r-t- 
cn w 

r+  o 
r+ 

P,) 
P-,  

Of'Q ' 
im-, 	ri  A) 

r-i- 
$--, • 

.. 

CD 	P 	CD 0) 

(11.) t7 hilt 
	

9LOZ .0t* 6ZllJ 'hi't 	̀1461zth 	99 



1-11-11 4 (TT) 
	

11t2151tql {TALI(, fq-it-  29 3-4(1 2016 	 367 

se
s  

o
f 

th
e  

M
a
d h

ya
  

be
rs

,  d
is

pe
n

s  

a  
p

er
so

n  
ag

  

aC 

0 
• H 
-4--)  
al 

r•-4 

a 0 
r4 
k 

	

a) 	a) 
pi 

0 a) 
p.4 r  

	

, 	 El 

	

0 	 ro 

4-,  

	

Q.) 	 Q.) CO 
'4-9,  a) 

	

a) 	co -4-) 
• r-i 4-/ 

Q.) 

0 
o 

=
v) 

	

rdp 	 4-) 
C.) 

(.) 	Cr
. ... 
0 .5 

(...) 	.,...., 

	

Cl) 	0 	t) —Cl) 	 (i) 
Y 0 i 

o 0 	
;•4 

04 

_C 	;-•J 	
Cl) 

	

Q.) 	+i ✓ t; 

0 

14--t 
0 

;,-..., 

	

.2 	
. 

. 0 
u 

	

1-i-s 	= 	
. 

i-,  0 rcl 	 0 Q) .,--, 	a) 	1-4 	0 , V ro A 
.,?_,- 	o 	0 	+.) 14 a) 	(..) 	4.1 	H 	.,..4 

-f gi 
a) 

	

-,.J 0 	 r4 (..) a) 1 	Li 
* 

	

.° 	5 	cci , 
› 0 

	

(L) 73 a) 	0 a) 	a) 	k 	(..) 
412 CO —01  a) 0 a) 

	

-4--J 	CA cd 	cr) 	r. 
(L)  

	

$-, 	 7,_ 
c-c; 	..4 T 	 " ., 

O g• v) 	 cu 
isi 	4 a) • 4) 

	

ai 	.+J 5  
co 	Cl) 	-1 	$-4 

cd 0 

0 (1) 

	

_ A u) a.) a) 	•-•4 

,--. 

	

X 	r-a' 

R
es

po
nd

en
t"

 



CD 
0 

CD 
1-41 
0 

0 

N. 

CD 

0 

CD 

 

)-t 
(1) 

CD 
0"-A  

0 

w . ci, 	CD 
c) 	o 	,--t 	>4 

o cr4 0 

5 
0 hti t-4-, 

P 
0 	

0 
0 . (- 	k4 	.0 

CO EA, 	w w,.., 	... • 

CM 0 r-14 	w 

w fl  0 
cr 0 	--t 

Co 
CD 

CD 0  
0 " n  

s' M  CD 
-,-., • 	r+. 	X 
p 0 it 

t—t 
-Cf-:2"- 

	

PD 	
r+ 

0) 

EA W  

	

Po 	
P r+ 
0 0 tra 

5 r+ t:TA  
(I) 0 
'"1 	x 

PD 

r+ 

E  0 
o .4, • 	(1) 	CD 
P3  
Cig 
0 	0) 
Co 	, • 
.. 

910Z aW 6Z  	14.15.12ah. 	89 



IZ[T (1,314-A, Riii"T 29 3-4-0.  2016 	 369 Tri_4 (ri)  

al
  f

av
ou

rs
  

05 a 

stu 

in
cl

u
d i

n
g
  o

ve
rt

 

ta
lk

in
g

  o
r  

c 

	

4-1 	(I.) 

	

0 	
. 

	

4-) 	U 
V 
V 

	

r0 	ta0  

O k U 0) 

	

C) 	(1) 	k 

	

r.- 	
,-0 

,-0 
a) 	0 

	

c:) 	• 	 a) 

	

k 	• 

ci 

 

a) 

al o O k 
ci 

 

	

k 	--(Ii-1) 	
al 
a) 	-4-1 

0 
O (I) 

a) 
rio P-, 

	

> 	a) 	a) 
(-1-4 

	

r-j 	
a) 
$--, 	. 
	rci 
-4G 

	

c.) 	P., 	a) 	-5 

	

., 	v.0 	o 

	

If) 	Li--4 
O 4-4 	r

rci 	

0 
O W a) 

	

P-i 	(i)  

fl 	
cci 
a) 	

cd 
0  a) 

k 4 
$, o 

0 
0 -4-, 	:4r-1  

	

r-e) 	• v-i 
0 	• ',:di 

	

-.-)' 	
• r-i 

rrli 
0 0 P"4 X 

	

a) 	X 	a) 

	

TS 	k 	
a) 	

1-1 

	

0 	(1) 	$--1 
0 0 

0 rd 

	

Cli 	rci 	a) 

	

(0 	o 	a) 
. r-i 	

•,_.1 

	

P4 	Piri 

. 	.fl 

cn 

0 
t4-4 

0 

.5  



bfl 

n
is

tr
at

iv
e  

B
lo

ck
 ,i

f 

4-) 

or
  c

on
te

nt
  l

ik
e l

y  
to

  

in
te

rf
er

es
  w

ith
 h
er

  

370 	 TTuTtAkw UPTT, fq-lich 29 3-41 2016 	 [ 1-1P1 4 (TT) 



(a
) T

he
 H

ig
h  

C
o
u
rt

 C
om

m
it

te
e:

 

as
 f
a
r a
s
 p
ra

ct
ic

ab
le

, 
in

cl
u

d
e
 th

e 
fo

llo
w

in
g:

 
0 

i. 

Cig 

0 

CT
Cti 
cn 

rf 

CD 

CD 

CD 
1-1 

ct. 

u
o -p:e sg Ts u

os  "G
en

de
r 

S
en

si
ti

sa
ti
on

 A
n

d  
In

te
rn

al
  C

om
p
la

in
ts

 
tt

ee
"  

(G
SI

C
C
) 
fo

r
 th

e 
H

ig
h

  C
o
u

rt
 an

d
  t

h
e 

Q 011-s n
r P

R
O

  31-1, 1,  (I) 

0 

CD 
CD 

0 

CD 

CD 
C) 

1 

C
O

M
PO

S
IT

IO
N

 A
N

D
  C

O
N

S
T

IT
U

TI
O

N
 O

F 
G

E
N

D
E

R
 S

E
N

S
IT

IS
A

TI
O
N

 A
N

D
 

c-t- 

tt
ee

"  
(G

S
IC

C
) 
fo

r
 Su

b
or

d i
n

at
e 

C
o 

r-+ 
0 

• 
0 cp 

I-4 • 
CD 

• CIA 
c-÷ rt) 
,cD 	CD 

rF 	Cfcl 0 
Cr 
0 	OA, 

0 
0 

1-41 

rf 

0 

CD 	CD 

cp 

p CD 

• 

0 CD 

p 
CD < 
o 
1-41 

0 k 

0 
,-4-) 

CD 

gH r+.  CIQ 

CD 
0 

m

ci 
CD 

P. 

r-t- CD 
0 

0 

-00
-p.sn

r  

I LE 

CD 

91.0Z aVe 	‘101[1,1  451ri1t 	[ (11) V Wit 



on
e 

fo
rm

er
 J

u
d
g
e
 (-w

h
e
r
e
 a
va

il
a
b
le

) 

r+ 34 

CD 

D
is

tr
ic

t 
C

ou
rt

 C
om

m
it

te
e:

- • 

C r+ P) 
• P-1 	4 (I) 	< 
• o 

	

5. 	
0 	P 

CD 
a 

al •-t• 

	

,--1 	`c 
o 

	

0 0 	p 

.-s 	,-t 

	

0 ,--t- P 	p r+ 1-11 
O a& 

	

P) 	(I) Et. 	0 
CD CD 

	

0 Cia 	r+ 
O 0 

0 
H 4; 

	

. . 	
CD 

	

CO 	" 
a 

H- 	i--. • 

	

r-+ r± 	0 CD 	o 	,--i 	0 CD • 
(3` 

	

a 	P 	1-• 
0-,  

	

C 	A) 

	

0 	0 	r+ 

0 

	

0 	
r) 	a 
P 
CD 

., 

	

,-,• 	r+ 
CY' 

	

CD 	5' 
r+ 

P-. 

	

1-1 	rq: 
0' 	a 

t-  

a
l O

Q
S

  I
Q

q. ELT QT A
I  

c/P 
(5:-A  CD 

$-41 

r+ C'D 	0 

t:)CDCr' a 
CD r-4- - 

CD 5'. C ) 	0 E.  
0 

r-+ 
Li 	H 54  

(AI 	r+- p 
St! 	CD 	Cn 

a,  CD 

cf 0 
,--e-) 

E' 	
i-g • 
(A 

CD 

U 

.▪ 	(/) 
0 

	

n 	r+ ti , 
L-4 P)  

	

0 	' 
r+ a,  0 

dcl 
CD CD a 

	

w 	,,, • 

	

w 	0 
--i-) 

5 

II 

  

a 

a
 

0 

CID 

(it) t7 allt 	9L& 	1414.1n1/ 



ITT 4 (r1) Trari;r- T 	f-citw 29 3T1-  2016 

a) 

II 

es
ta

bl
is

h
m

en
t  

of
 c

on
ce

rn
e d

  j
u

di
ci

al
 D

is
tr

ic
t,

  n
ot

  

0 
- 

a) 

0 

bn 

tx0 

ot
h

er
  p

e r
so

n
  (s

)  n
om

in
at

ed
 by

  th
e  

D
is

tr
ic

t  
ju

dg
e.

  

a) P-4 
CD 

	

) 	( $.-1 	r(01 	•'121  
r- 	

V 	 CU (/) T- 	 U 
rti 	 cd 
a) 	y-ç1 ,2 4 
(f) fr

om
  't

h
e  

a
ll
o
ca

te
d
  f
u

n
ds

  f
o r

  h
ol

di
n

g  
th

e  
p

ro
ce

ed
in

gs
  o

f 
th

e  
G

S
IC

C
 a

s  
m

ay
  b

e  
p

re
sc

ri b
ed

 in
  t
h

e  



T
h
e
 te
im

 of
  e

a
ch

  m
em

b
e
r
 of

  t
h

e 
G

S
IC
C

 sh
a
ll
  b

e
 f

or
 

5
.
 T
er

m
 of

  G
en

de
r S

en
si

ti
sa

ti
on

 

b
ei

n
g
 n
om

in
at

ed
/s

el
ec

te
d
 f
o
r
 a
 in
 

'SUT T
O

 OA  J
o  p

op
od

 

0 

CD 

(J) 

L. CD 
CD 

CD 
• r+ 

• CD 

P.) 
cp 

0" 
CD 04  
CD 	CD 

11 

CD 

CD 

CD 
çi 

rD 

c14  

0 

03 
CO 

0 

cc' 
(*D 
CD 

Ca 
Cr 

CD 

0 

i. 

e+ 
0 

(IA 

`Qct  k
a u

  os
o 	

si
ca

p
n

y  1.0  

CD 

CD 

jo  uoTu
I do  

C
h

ie
f  

Ju
st

ic
e
 o
r t

h
e 

D
is

tr
ic

t J
u

d
ge
,
 

a
s
 th
e
 ca

se
 m

ay
 b

e,
 h

a
s
 s
o
 ab

u
se

d  

y
 n

ot
ifi

ca
ti

on
s/

or
de

rs
 is

s u
ed

 th
er

eu
n

de
r;
 or
 

Co 
0 

CD  
r+  cn C-) 	-.-- _--` 	CD 

0 	q 
.-4 - 
0 ° I. 
0 fij• — 	''-• 

0 	0 
1-I 	0 
W 
O Po 
0 	w 

,--t- 
O 0 
,-I 	1--1 CD 

0 
CD 	DA 

0 	
CD 
9 

Cr  
CD  
,--t 	60 ,..„ 

b" P 	(-D CI) 	,--t 

53' 	
n 0 

co 
C) 	g. A) 
w 
cD 
,---, 	o 

L.  
a' 	o 
SD  0 
Ci) 	CD 

tl 

cD.  
Cn . 
c-- 

El: 
. 	0 1-,  • 

-I 0 

O Ri 
CD 

X 
O I—i 

4 	,g. w 
. 	a 

5' 	
0 }...„ 
, ,--, H 0 o 
0'. 

5t 	
0 
o a 	w 

910Z at* 6Z 	`kh11,1?  14111zili. 	tLE 



WI 4 (11) 74tAtkr1 	-k-it* 29 34a 2016 

 

375 

  

	

0 	 ,a) 	-1-J 
0 

0 >1 
Q.) 

	

*4:t 	T- 	— 	0 	1..„.4 

	

ai 	w ti-i 	*-0 0 

	

.g 	 0  

	

W 	
0 
0 

+.) 0 a) 
•E 	+-) 	1..., 

	

a) 0 	-ci) 

	

rd. 	 o ra 	ai a) 

	

0 	a) 	0 '0 $-4 

	

a) 	(f) 	 a) 

	

co 	 a) *In g 
t 

	

0 	
a) 
> 

	

*-0 	T1 ri a) 	0 
a) 

	

0 	 co 	co 
a) 

••0 
 

	

cci 	 P4 

go, 	,, 	'CI 
a) 4-) 

'• 	
--i 0 

a)
qc-5 

w bn  
0 0 

a) 	0 	Ti (/)  +-3 	0 	a) W 5 
c) 	4-4,  p.4  -4--) 

5 5 
(/) 

'‘al 0 0 ai . rd ci) p., 
O cti 	 0 	,da„ 

o u) (1)  0 - .0 	00 rct 0 	a) (f) 
(i) 	r ▪ 0 	0 	(1) 

Cf.) 	 1E3 +-) 	(1) _ti 	•41  
0 	ti-4 
. 	 0 	. 0 	li  ° bn 
134-4 	CO (4--4 	0 0 (/) 'V. 
E 	g 0   
0 	V 	 (4 cy., 
0 	E (1) 

rfD 8 , 
,r0 w  

$-4 	0 
4) 	0 	FO  

-4--' 	C.) 	0 	1-4 	0 
- 	be 6 	8 	tio 
r ri 	'8 bfl 

, 	r 
.4., • 0 v ,._, 

*r§ 
' 

o 
@ 	t,l, 	al 	' co . 

,.., 10 	0 0 (t) 0 	. E 	0 4 
o 1 

	

"-P1 0  1 te r2 	1)  
°du)  cd ,4 0 (1)  cid '413  Cl) 	+-. 	Cl)  

	

48. 	
0 

t) 0 
Cl) 

	

+-) 	t. '5 	 v 

	

a) 	(1)  
• (I) 18 	I-3 tp 	E -5 . . a) 0 

	

0) 	• ci) 	0 

	

rci 	04 	r.- ,  

	

0 	$-1 

	

a) 	(1) 	tan 	46 	(1)  .4. 

	

(D  %0 
	CE) 

	

".1q 	' u  6 

	

0) > 	 () 	

1
-12 ) 

 

- 
r)  

• o 	&.--- Li-A 	Fo- .1:1  

(G
! 

4r. ) 

rn 

cd 

•E 

0 
ci- 

0 

co 

(16 (16 



r+- 
0 

(2
) 
G

en
d
er

 S
en

si
ti

sa
ti

on
 an

d
  O

ri
en

ta
ti
on

: 
G

S
IC

C
  s

h
al

l  
ta

k
e
 th
e
 f o

llo
w

in
g
 st

ep
s
 w

it
h

  r
eg

ar
d  

to
 

at. 14  J
o

  s
t roT

43
u

n
a
  • 2,  

0 
th

e 
D

is
tr

ic
t J

u
d

ge
,
 

a
s
 th
e
 ca

s&
  m

ay
 b

e;
 

an
d  

th
e
 va

ca
nc
y
 so

 cr
ea

t e
d  

sh
al
l
 be

 fil
le

d
  i
n

 ac
co

rd
an

ce
 

A
 M

em
b
e
r
 n
o
t a

tt
en

di
n
g
 3
 co

n
se

cu
ti
v
e
 m

ee
ti

n
g
s
 m

ay
 b
e
 re

m
ov

ed
  b
y
 th

e 
C

h
ie

f  
Ju

st
ic

e
 or

 

CD 

Cl) 
0 

C/) 

d
ay

s
 re

qu
es

t
 th

e 
C

h
ai

rp
e r

s
o
n

 to
 ca

ll  
ei

th
e
r
 an

 

aQ1, 4  
o
o

-qn
s  

e
T TJQ

U
I 

o
;  2u

p.boT AI  A
ou

a
iQ

u
ra

  _To  

S
U

OT1.0
111  f ry

  

4.am
as -..t ocr a ial AT  

17 Wit 	
91,0Z L?XjIc 6Z 	`khi,D  415.1att 	9L 



-14t21 1  1‘,1P-171, 	29 alto  2016 	 377 

••••••••• 

1-, 

1.-)1 	
0 	(I) e4i 

 

r, 	
c) 5. 	 VI (1) 

0 
o Pi Or 

t - 	
' 

-1 V, •o Co 
 F-4 

0 	
U) 0  

w 	 (1) 
0 

.4-4 	
t---4 	rd 	' 0

0 	. 	0 

4-3 	0.) 	 C..) 	
(D) ai 4-) 	 Co  

	

.. 	,-, 	0 
Co cd 	

6' 

.-0 0 	4 0 
 

• ,-4 	. r.4 	b.0 	 0 	t))° r.  
Co
0 'L) 

	

	 It 
V) 	

j. ___. 	• 1-1 
(1) . 	

Ei 0  
Pi 	W 
Co  c) 

	

ri 	
-4-J 	TD 	• T-1 	• r-1 

	

rd 	
0 X) 	a) o 

k 0 	 0 >1 • 	
4 

(I) 	
4--) 	0 	

( 
.4--) 	X) 	.1;4 	

Cl) 
Cd 

0 	
bi3 	 0 Cord (I) 

(1)bn 0 
	r:1 a) r0 

5, 0 +-, 	rd 	
a 0 (i) ._, 

0 0 	0 	a) (1) 0 o 	6 	co rd a) 	 Cl) 

O co 0 .5 	
0 

0 	.t,),40 	 ..4 	 ..4 

(7) al 
a) a) 0 	 cd 

,n  
?-4 	

rp 	
• ri 

6 	 (/) biD 

Co 
t 	

0 

	

Q.) 	Cl) 	
r--4 

	

47-14 	0 

a) 	C: 	o 
4-1 	rd 	0 	 r• 	(4-1 	CO ci 

	

CO 	0 

an 6 
 

(1) 	alf 
0 q 	C.) 	

a) 	(1) 

•,-, 	 4-, 	T.', 	tu) 
,c Cl) 	

k  

Co 	u Co 	o 	a) 

Cl, aS 	6 ct 
d cl, cu ro 	in 	

> 0 

	

ro 	0 

r8 	
,.. 
0 . 0 0 0 

	

0 	z 
0 

d H-i 
,0 	

0 0.4) 0 (1) u  

4,-) 	

4-4 
,--. 	4 

0 k (I)  
P w 	

ci) 
ai bn 0 0 

(4)) ' o 

0 l7 
Pi PC 

✓ 
C14 cf) 	 E 

;Ir5 	cal  71)4  

+.J 0 
	0 

•-•4 	
0 

±-) 
a) .,424 	Fa l'  -8 	

a) 

rci 	-8 	fai 	ct 	+.-) c) 	 6 O r0 

CU V) 
(ic ra 	0 0 rCi 	

P4  

Ct 	te r".8 Q ',- 
0 

0 Co 	
rtl  ?) 	al 0 	 g 

O 0 r'Sj 	b.0 (5) (IC 
 

6.  bIJ 

r-i rd Cd 	 0 	 cil 

O 7,1  T_I 	 (I) ,4 r() 
	

r0 

..-rit 
(4 	. 	. 	

-4-) 	(4 
d 	

'--D 

co 	(-4. 	0 

	

4-.) (.) 	U 	731)  5  '5 0 
cn o .2 c.) (..) rd - 	cci 0 ',0  -.0 7)  

Fn-4 _ .4-- 	
0 	).--i 	k.. 	En 	C-  15 	• r 1 -)i 	- r-i' 	rci 	ed  

0.) 	 • ,--i 	Cl) 	0 	.-, 	
0 

	

rd 0 '1) 0 (. r0 2 C,D 
	rt o 0 

	

r--4 	o 	0.)  
::: 8 

ta) ..z..4, p.4. Di 	Cf) PI 	
0 L4-i 



•
 

S
Q

. 1 1 1
p @

3
O
Id

  

CD 

5. 

CD 

r+ 

ci 
CD 

0-4  
0 
ci 
CD 
(/) 

0 

CD 

CD 
ci 

CD 
CIR 

I 

P)_ 

0 

ct. 
CD 

r+ 

0 

H- 

5.4t- 

CD 

CD 

O
S

 @ II I,  
*S I 0

01.11 rLI O
A

 

CD 

S
I O

Q
I.T. IrlI O

A
  li o n

s  J
o 

OTI 

cp 
CD 
ci 

't cx 
c°  0 hi 

• ca. 
1--- 	Rt - 

hCi 
A) (DO 
r-t- n 
(i) 

0 

'6.  o 

0 j Cl) 
o .. 

o 

	

. 	* 
4. 
w 

0 
0 

CD OA 

RA. 0 
W )-4-) 
a o 0 0 
0 

,-I rt) 	(I fa,  
0 
O . o 
1) 	(4 

CD 
W 0 

O " 

o N ca o 
0 cx 

P P-a 
ti 0 

. 0 
0 .0. 

w 	< 
sa. 0 

6 Q-A a' 
cp 	W 	(1) 

CD 

	

CD 	'`I 
- W 

b-4 	--) 
cn CD 
0 

CDC .) 
,,, '---; 

n Cl) CD 	0 

(''ft 	
CD' 

(51- 
Po 0 
0 a. w ,. 0 	cn 
r—t- 

til 

i--).  

r4 
P- 	i---t- 	CD 

O
r  J

O
 3I S 'el.  

t7 wit 
	91.0Z .0.t* 6Z JhJ `V. 1111,1?  iwtizia 	211 



tziliZ\JT   29 340 2016 	 379  

	

-16 trA • 	Ici—i) 	 (1) 	
w 

Cl)

,q +-0:) 
7 

(1) 	r0 	w 	
• ,-.1 	00 

Co 
 -4-, 	AI 	

§ Z 4--)  (I) 

	

cd 	.4--) 	P 	4 ).-4., 
 

CO  
0.) ro ?--, . 	(I) 	 0  

0 g ri 4-1 
ai 

	

0 0 	4C-/) P-1 4 -kJ 	, , 	0rcs 	0  
V 	 47)) sr ILI u) • 	u) . 	1 /4'' 	> 	 bp a) C) 

a) 0 	
cd 

	

. 0 	0 
t-, 

> 	 al 0  E 	
(/) 	0) 	0 . 

(/) 
Cl) 
cci 	

rd ci .., 
741-1  $-.4 	0 

e rl 	Cf) 4C-3  '--4 il:J ras r(i tan 	 nj 
0 	

. 
+-) 	.."*---• 	 0 	v) 

a V e> 
	 a) 

$-, 	
rci 

; 	 it-, 	
v) 
(,) 

	

0 	. (I) 	 (I) 	0  0 0) as 0 -1--) 	0 a) 0 	PI 
0 

TO 	rd 

a) 	.' 
0 r 1  ) c dpr 1  li  

	

a) . (i) 	rf) 	 al 	 ed 
O 'ZS rci 	 a) 
co 	 r --a i uce; 	g 	.1...J 

0 	- 2 	,(e.  
a) 	 „_q 

0 
0 p.4 	4_, 

	

al rc= Jr:8 	as ID 
. 111 	 )---I 	Cti 	.. 	 0 	(1) 	0 	i  

co 0 
• 

Ci) 	 "ti , a) ri (1) 0 o 	 ,4 	.a) 
4 > Co . 	 TO 

o 

-4- 	
4 (1) riCS  q 6 Cd 	 ti 0, 0 R 4a1 rc:i 	cp 	(f) 

0 	cs) 	0 	0 	al 	i, 	
V) 	

• r-4 0 	 t-4 
0 0 

	

To 0 	 -(1) 0 0 .4)  › 	4) o ej 	-----_, 	a) 	 -4--) 
.; -4-icf).  

o 
• .--4 	 > 	. ,-.1 	4..) 	0 	1-4 	4) 	

k 	1 	- SD 

r•- 	JD 	W 	 • r--4 	(/) 	4 	Q.) 	d 	 CD 

(1) 	 • r--4 	Ci) 	rd 
 (C/,,), 	.E3 

fp. 8 0 (-) 0 4 V u 	• cl) 4 	0 	,- -i--) 
cz 0 t-4 
w a) 	P., 	Ca-, 	E 	C7) 	4-) 	-4-) 	 ci) 	• 1--4 	,--4 	• r-.4 	P.4 	0 	. k",11{)  0.) 	 r• 

. C-44 	0 
-4—) 

0 4) 0 	:4-' 	,14) 	0 	cu 	v) 	4) 	a) 	0) 	0 	0 	"'if • 	 0 
• , 	bA 	u) t--4 r0 	> 

O r  ..., ) 
Go o 4• 0.3 0 u

a) 0 0 TO 0 4-1  

rdd 
• 4-) 	rci 	.o. ru 	• -- 	,,. 	 0 	1-4 	CO  
a) 

.. 
t-i ,.. 1

4 
 -4  (1) 

0 
0
„) 

E ., 	4-d 	 r0 
r.i 	,-4 	--_, 	0 	E 	-4--' 	0  u ,1 

ro 	tri ro 	
•  

0 0 (1) • 
	 CO cci o "0 	• r•4 	 (1) 	a) 	(i)  

*El) 	' T-1 
 . $-‘ 

Co 5 
u) 	cci., 	— 	•--1 -- 

	a) 

	

r---, 	,--(  ri 
+-J 
O 

Ci) y. 
Cl)

g 47 r. 5j 8  g 	0  

• v-4 	-.4 	. 	 a) 
w o co 	•••••-•0 	a) 
cd '0  ---.3 8 ...,) .cd u ro b,0 — 	 (--4 ---. •;-.4 0w 	c.) 	(......, 	,,,i 	› 	.5 	. 	0 

.±-i ,Lti 71 cn  0 	'4i Cn 0 rcp  r-. cd '  
t a) (1)  __f3 	--i •:C4 (  (03 	 rda) ri 0 

O 0 	 r0 	 4.) , $--4 	 „, 	 r-1 
'c-f3 C.) 0 
	41 	0 a) — 	E +--) 0 

a) 	 a) 	

73 	.,...,  

.,,• 	f) 	:74- 4 	w 	(i) 	0., d 0 	o • 1-1  • v'.-Ir X  



2,2  Q
q ;  a

a a -q m
  

0 

0 

_to 	
a@ LT  J o  

su o
p w

rt 2aei  Q
s am

  

R
ue  o

;  o n
p

  

cio  q
s ap E_ Id  .e/C 

Cl) 
CD H CD 
A) 0 
• • CD 
• CD 

çi 

rPt- 

CD 
CD 

CD 

CrQ 

CD 

rit 

0 

0-4 

• 0  

j. 
PO 

ci) 

10: 

0 
1-1 r—fr 
CD 

L.< 

rai 

0 

CO 
CD 

CD 

CD 

crti.  

PL)
0  

r+ 
0 

;E
 

fo
rm

 an
d

  p
ro

ce
du

re
 so

 n
o

ti
fie

d  
by

 i
t.

 

0 

910Z 14.1 6Z _L§.11-_1).J. 'h1J) 1izth 	08E 



9.
  I

n
qu

ir
y  

in
to

  c
o

m
pl

a i
n
t-

  (
  

G
S

IC
C

  s
ha

ll
 c

on
st

it
u

te
  

0 

0 

re
e  

m
em

be
rs

  o
f 
t h

e  
G

S
IC

C
  i

ts
el

f;
  o

r  
su

ch
 

n
at

ed
 by

  t
h

e  
G

S
IC

C
 in

  i
ts

  m
ee

t i
n

g,
  w

it
h

 m
aj

or
it

y  
m

em
b
er

s  
be

in
g  

ot
h

er
  p

er
so

n
s  

a
s  

to
  b

e  
so

  n
o  

la
tio

n
  1

3(
2)

,  a
n

d
 t

h
er

ea
ft

er
  i

t  
sh

al
l  p

re
pa

re
  a

  R
ep

or
t  

m
e,

  s
u

bj
ec

t  
to

  t
h

e  
p

ro
vi

si
on

s  
o
f 

R
 

an
d 

en
cl

os
e  

th
er

ei
n

  t
h

e  
co

m
p
le

te
  p

ro
ce

ed
in

gs
  o

f 
th

e  
In

qu
ir

y.
  

ITTTT 4 (IT) ] 
	

"glitz, ,&1\r1t4f, fe,--ifT 29 at@ 2016 	 381 

t4--, 
0 
Co 	0 0. 

cn co cci 	..„ 
-ti 
0 q-i 

g 	..0 
0 0 •fj 

N 	
0 
a) 0 
0 rcl 	cy(  75 a) +-, 	d -4 

ri:114 0 r0 
a) o 

o 

0 nzi 

-0 	4.,  0 
C) 	o 4-, 	0 a) 
O ,r) 

'-Ug v) 
0 	.. 	0 o 
O v) 0 

Co 
C) ai 

a) 

6 04  o 
,_. 	sa.)  

4) 

o rd  
. rd 'co 

P-I 0 	0 

O rrS 	a) 
C.) 	

4-4 ' p1 
CZ (/) 0 rd 

(0 
2 tr--  
• E 

› 
4-4 
r- 	• . 	io y) .-.. 	Q, 

O ct ...d 	• ,=-1 

O 4-) •,-, ri  rizi 5 .i.... 
-r-L1 	

a) 
rd rci -.0 CO 	.,-- a) +, 0 E a)  

O 10L; 7.9., 0 

U) 	o 
6 	

0 
0 ( 3

)  T
h

e  
fa

ct
  E

n  

C
om

m
itt

ee
.  



r+ 
CD 
CD 

CD 

d
  R

es
po

n
de

n
t 

in
 pe

rs
on
,
 

re
co

rd
  i

ts
 re

as
on

s 

re-ur olu
i  

!p an a
lc i u

Qaq.  
p

Li aL LI T.11 0 3O.  
It eLI S  

th
e 

G
S

IC
C

  t
o
 ta

k
e
 ap

pr
op

ri
at
e
 ac

ti
on

 f
or

 

r+ 

P
T  p

u
p  .rajjlp

  
)11

 
J@TJ P 	

D
C 

-q n
s  t e u i al u

i 	
jo  u

o d
aa  

u
a -p oP  1.u

o n ba su
o 3  

CD 

< 

TI I0 Ij  

C O 

0 

p
o dou

  Ax ic n bui  .O
T  

r+ 
r+ 
CD 
CD 

CD 

5' 
,n 

0 

CD 

CD 

O
D

  - CM
S

  r e
 11. 1@

; 11I  @Lg.  0.1 3 

tt
ee

 i
s
 of

  t
h
e
 op

in
io

n
 th

a
t t

h
e
 al

le
ga

ti
o
n

 ag
ai

n
s
t t

h
e 

R
es

p
on

d
en

t 

*O
D
IS

0
  am

.  al  

Q 

9 LOZ ave 6Z (-1,!t*i 	Z8 E 



rra-,  

Co 

th
e  

G
S

IC
C

 

• 
0 

-Ef 

i1TT1 4 (q) 
	

11211 1 t1‘311471, 1c-c9tT 29 31t1 2016 	 383 

ra-3 
rci 

bJ3 
0 •rl  

a) 

01 .  



0 

CO 

of
  M

ad
hy

a 
P

ra
de

sh
  
or

, 
S

u
b
o
rd

in
a
te

 

ua  J
o  

-4. u
a 

or
de

rs
 ag

ai
n

s
t t

h
e 

R
es

p
on

d
en

t 
in

cl
u

di
n

g,
 b
u

t n
ot

 

: 2u
im

ou oj  o tp.o
.  `13 Q1I  

0 

t-+ 
0 

SI C
  p

g
11 1Q

0 1 100
 

`5Q
2

P
5S

QUEI  
`sauotld

 SP
 L ion s  

CD 
CD 

qt.  
0 

• 

Pp 

A) CO  ti 4,  
Ort 

	

ClOb  . 	CD 
CO ,mo 0  

	

CD 	--, 0 

	

cl 	0 CT() ..,.. 	)--s . 
P 0 --i 0 

n 5 
CD 

H a, H 
H EA

)* 
',"-i_ 

0 

ri) 	n) 	'6.  
cm 

0-,  (4 
--) .1. 

cpg o gi )--t 
CO 
r-t- P 
ri) 	CO 	(1) 
ti i-d 11 
0) CD 
0 0 51 
CD 51' 

CD cl 
n c'D 
cn 
cn ti ,- CD 

';1• 
0 
ci --+-) 

0 	
•.41 • 

,--1 	n 

5,_ 
CO 

V rrn 
CD 
0 
t-t- 
r+ 
0 

CD 

	

CD 
	

0 

L 

kid 
ri) . p 

	

CO 	CO 

CD 

0 
1-41  

CD 

	

cp 
	cn 

(11
) 
by

 p
u

b
li
ca

ti
o
n

 in
 ca

u
se

 l
is

t o
f t

h
e
 H

ig
h  

C
o
u

rt
 o
r t

h
e 

cf 

 

CD 

ci 
t-t- 
0 

9LOZ ItIte* 6Z .9.41-j  	 142istn1t 178 



01 
T-I 

u
n

de
r  

th
e  

A
dv

oc
at

es
  A

ct
,  

sh
al
l
 h
av

e  
th

e  
ju

ri
sd

ic
ti

on
  t

o
  

0 

0 
Ti• 

a) 

co
m

p
la

in
t  

a
n

d
/o

r  
a
  d

is
ci

p
lin

ar
y  

cd 
4-1 
0 • 

CO 

or
,  
th

e  
c
o

n
ce

rn
in

g  
D

is
tr

ic
t  

Ju
dg

e,
  

0 

if) 

• th
e  

C
h

ie
f
 J

u
st

ic
e  

TitzUkT 1Tq4'q, 	29 314-6 2016 	 385 WI 4 ( TO 

V 
* r-i 

6 
0 o 

--0 
0 
W 
.,,. 
-4-,  

.2 

p., 0 
o 0 .,.,, 

O (KS 
q 

4--) 
--0 tO 0 

	

0 	• ,-.4 

	

g 	(1) 
O rU 4 

:- 
(1) • 0 0 0 4-) 

4-)t--

(I) e-i 4) 0 4--) 	• r-i 	cd 	Pi 0 0 +-) 
O _,., 	cu 

	

cd 	a) . k 

g o 
'"C op >1 

k

r0 

r-4 4-4 
a) 

E-Qi 	'-. 

, , 	c:i 	rci 
a) 

0 U r L.) 	r 	ri 	a) 
CI) 	ri 

	

,-- 	
a) 

.-0  
(D 4-' 

	

0 	a) 
> 
r,--4 

a) 	H H cd 
'KT 8 8 



s iop
a o  g

o n
g 

ck ) 

CD 

0 

CD 

CD 
CD 
Co 

crq 

Co

ci  
CD 

CD 

CD 

SD 

0 
CO 

0'4  

(-D 

CD

ci 

CD 

ct) r+ 

(PO'  

0 
ci 

m
ay

 m
ak
e
 a
 re

pr
es

en
ta

ti
o
n

 to
 th

e 
C

  
ef

  J
u

st
ic

e
 of

  t
h

e 
H

ig
h  

C
o
u

rt
 or
,
 th
e
 co

nc
er

ni
n

g 
D

is
tr

ic
t 

G
S

IC
C

  t
o
 th

e 
C

h
ie

f  
Ju

st
ic

e
 of

  H
ig

h
  C

o
u

rt
 or
,
 

th
e
 co

n
ce

 
th
e
 or

de
r
 pa

ss
ed

  b
y
 th

e 
G

S
IC

C
 u
n

de
r
 R

eg
u

la
ti
on

 1
1
 

 

:Aq  p
gAal.1 22-e  u

os io
d . a

rv
  (I )  

 

D
is

tr
ic

t 
Ju

d
ge
,
 

a
s
 th
e
 ca

se
 m

ay
 b

e 

or 
r
ec

omme

nd
ati
on 

mad

e b
y 
5.4t- 
CD 

 

(II) 17 Wit ] 
	

9LOZ 4I2 6Z  	98 



ct
  J

u
dg

e,
  

th
e  

c
on

ce
rn

in
g
  D

i,  
rtj 

de
r  

cl
au

se
  (

1)
  

411T 4 (TI) 
	

1:Itz131kV 	 f"-citW 29 3111T 2016 	 387 

ci 

g 
cd E 
+., 

4 b +-, k , 
O re 
k 	a) 	(1). a) > 

O '6) 

rd 	CL) 
1-4 

cr) 
etto 
cid 	1) 

a) 
a) 

• t. in . r--4 	0 	
Ti 

• -• 	-1  

P w 1:-E1 X) 
o 0  . 0 
C.) ccl a) en 

,IP 	bA . cd 
4 

P 	
• F-4 	w 4 .▪ d  

(4--i 	-ci 
w tj  0 ,44- 

0 	cu 
aJ jj rd k 
a) LI- 	0 

co Pi 
co -4--; 	1-4 	(1)  

--4 cz , 49, r4  
a) c) rcs a) 
a) 
k 

ef
 J
u

st
ic

e  



:I@ 
 

cp 
q) p 	o 
0 < 	PA k_I PA 
oo cr) -1-J 

0 	n ., 	. CD ti 0 ,-.• 
• CD gs 	1-(-13-1 ,-i n n 	PA 
O w o w CD 0 

`,--1- 	L ,..--,4  i 	o 
( 0 
0 

0 ).41  

CIQ ti 0 b' 	
cfcl 

o 0 	o 4 
P •d  

.q 
cp n 

CD 	CD 	c:',1 
(/) CD 0 CD 	0 

*I 	p-fl 	"Ci 	0 
..,. U) H 	P .-t P Pa 

0 CD < 0 , 	• r+ 0 r+ 

4. c 	
0 tai 

--6 P Cl) 	li 	
CD 	. 

).-t 	A'3'  5 0 u) 5 
O a• n 0  ti (f) 0) i  0 

tid 	0 	•fcj 	0 	i  
CD 	0 0 0  rh (/) 

CD  4 
IS ;' 0 0 	Cl) •d 

r+ 	'q 	CI 	Fa.  

CD o r+ 	51 • Fl."‘ I-. • (D,  
11 -,4-, 	,-0 	rt. Oj  m 5 0., 	r+ 
0 	

Cl) 
CD )6* 0 D. 

CD Ne ,* 	ti 	XJ CrQ o 

	

P a, 	W 	r+ 
0)0) 2 o 

• 0 

. 	• 	
,--,. 

L-s  O P. 

	

CD 	o 
CPQ 	CD rt 

	

n ():-).4 	0 	ci,(t. 
o 0 	(..) 	,-t 

ca,  I' P 	co 
,-+- ,-+ 

0 

	

(f) 	Cla 	r+ 	,---3 

o 

	

CD 0 cl 5 	A 	cii CD 

	

CD CD 	CD  
X 	0 0 

- Ei 

p 	• CD r+ 5 

r÷ 0 	
0 () 
li w cit) 	0 	.., 	c) 

E.". 	ra, 

1 

	

CD W 	
--t 

'd 

	

0 04 	0 

	

1 	0 	CD p 
o 0 	P+ 	< 

0 	i_i• 0 	0 CD 
p 	. 	• o 

	

5A0 	,q, 5' cp 
R 0 o 

o n  

	

n a' 	CD 
(IQ 	CD a: 

< 0 	,--i 
CD t-t- 
Cl) 	P-i- 0 

s i a
m

o
d

  1;'T
•
 

910Z Kte 6Z 	̀KI-111'11  .14111nE1 	88E 



bi) • 

(1.) 

4-) 

0 

ti4:4 (4-4 
0 

r0 

4-4 
0 

tjtS 

th
e  

a
ss

is
ta

n
ce

  

0 

d 

•-0 

t-4 
cal 

a) 

cci m- 
u 4-,  

P-4 

a) 
(4;-)  

.q 

0 15
.  D

ut
ie

s-
  T

h
e  

G
SI

C
C

 in
  c

oo
r  

0 

a
ct

ed
 w

it
h

 b
ia

s  
in

  

4 (IT)] 
	

liugit411 	iclict) 29 34-0 2016 	 389 

4-4 

E 	• (b)  

T*4  

• ° 
o (,) • 

4-4 

ci  (cei 	Cl
) 

0 
.-*(7f* 

P • • 

C/) 
rj •N 4-4  

$.4 	0 

.) 	4') 	()) 
o p, 

() .C2 

ra 
civ 

cu cd 
w 

0 cis 	.74, 	4--)  

o 
 ro al .5. 

Ti 
4-1 

'al 

0 • 4) 	;-4 

0 
(1.)

Dco 

0  
Q4 

ro 	cci 
Cr) r0 

r-8 To 

rci  

-t4CL)  

e.) 	as 
E--4 	4,1 



CD 

o u
t w

o r
k
 th
e
 H

ig
h  

C
ou
r
t
 an

d
 pr

ec
in

ct
s
 of

  S
ub

-o
rd

i n
at
e
 C

o 

1-d 
CD 

0 

CD 

r+- 

CD 

,c-t1 • 

C-) 0 

(c
) 
d
is

p
la
y
 a
t a

 c o
n

s p
i c

u
ou

s
 p
la

ce
 i
n

 

@
S

P
O

  0
11;

  S
P

 

0 Ea- 0 	0 s 	C) -CT C • i-J 0 	0 --.....- • 
O N P 	

CD 

r+  R 
Cl)  
ch F,- 

t$ 0- c.)  •0: : 
" 	

ri•-• 
r+ 
CD 	

--.. 

r+ 
Cl) 	o. 

0, 	
co 
)-t 

— 	CD O CD 
e  pu 0 

C') 	n 	n (4 	0 o CD 	co 

N.) 	
0 

4 w Cl).H  o N. 
Li 	r,.. 

P 

Cfcl 	1--11 . t-nril"  p 	
. 

P 
a. 	5. 	0 	,—. 
o --: 
0 	CD 	I-,  • 
l•-•+-) 	P)* 	CD 
o ri-- 	CD 01) i '-i 	r+  

(It 	

(1) 
0 
fa. 	0 . 

0 	
5 CD 	(D 5 ,--i co 	CD 	)-4 

51) 
P 	0  
E 	., 	2, 

co 	E 54 
,--i (4 
th 

74 	ti 0 	w 04 
0 0 	0 	0- ,-d o P., 	1 	)--t 

0 
CD 

0 c 0  

CD
CD 	k 	

no; 
H.. 

0) 	CD 
CO 	co 
,...A. 	,-4-) f-t- 	o 

--t 
ca,  PCl)'n 

CD - 
r-t 	EA. CD 	0 ap 	Cicl 
5. 

N - CD • 

5' 	(q: co 

I 

0 
-.1 	'.6 	o 

co 	0 citl 	n 

N 

I1 

ci 	
e „.±. 0 	w 

E. a 	(?' 

D
J  

(IL) Wit 	9 LO Z aVe 6Z&t6k `h.lak11. 1411:ri1t 	06E 



it-TM 4 (TO 1112TSftJ1141, f-cii-W 29 3-11110' 2016 	 391 

0 

Cj 

	

6 	 (r—J 
k 
O VI 	iojo 

@ 
. cd 	 .a)" 

(h)  
(1) 

+.1 

	

(1) 	 • ,--i 

	

r•O 	 0 	
rC$ 

O H 
-1—)  

0 

	

(a) 	
a) 

	

ra 	".0 

	

g 	 1 
o 

	

--4 	 0 	a) 
O (/)-4 4.-4 4 

	

U) 	 T.-- 	
V 

rCi 

	

0 	 • 
o a) 

0 

	

a) 	co a) 

	

fn, 	 •rS a) 

4 

	

ra 	-, 0 
.,-.4 

	

rd 	• w 	cn 
O k 0 

	

(1) 	 P-1 	Cl) 

-r5-J 4 	
a) cd 

U) 4-4 

	

t-4 	 o 
a) 

	

rc) 	0 	I-4 

	

9 	• ,--4 O 0 

	

0 	
•-•,.., 

O rE 

O.' 	 * H 	cid 0 •„..4 	 rn 

	

-4-) 	 0 
O 0 	• r-L-)i 

	

Cti 	 •, 
> o 

	

a) 	 al 

	

4a1 	
a) 
E 4-J 

• 	 (1) 

0 

	

-1--) 	 -.4 

	

a) 	 0 
O tin 	.,- 4-) 

cd 	4 
0 

	

cd 	 o 
▪ (.) 	H 

:0—  so 	.- 	--,--, 4_, 	...,, 

41. 

be
  p

u
bl

is
h

ed
,  c

om
m

  

0 

.c47c)1 

a) 

o 

bes 

-55J 
t4.-t 

pr
oc

ee
d i

n
gs

,  r
ec

o  
re

la
ti

n
g  

to
  t

h
e  

in
qu

  

be
  c

on
fid

e n
ti
al

 a
n
d
 s

h
al

l 
n

ot
  

G
S I

C
C

 s
h

 

.1 



Tu
yp e oo

j pi  *S T r+- 

CD 

CD 

ra 

c  1 C-e
 I L I
 g o

g
s ric  j ai ti o

  

CD 

CD 

ci 
CD 

0
 LI ;
  ol  p

.e a
T
 O

.  

-In
o - cu T. m.  s

t i on :e 

Ij 

0
 LI T  J o  LI 0

 g
e 

CD 

(k) 
	

910Z Ka 6Z A.op-.N. 	141ifnEt. 	Z6C 



co
u
n

se
lo

rs
  

a) 	• 
ra 

sh
ab

le
  u

n
d
er

  

4 
	 2TT tt,T141, fi-r-,itW 29 340 2016 	 393 

0
.

1-1  

0 

rti 
u 

rcl a) 	LI-,  

o cid 

4cT'J 

0 

0 

0 

	

40 	 bb 

	

a) 	 '. 	 g 0 , 
0 

-2-' 	
•,-,,n 
g 
-f•Jm  0 

a) 	
•,-, 4--,  

C/) k 

g 	

k a) 
P.4 

1 
d 	g 	0 
0 	a) 

Cl) 
% 

	

V 	. a 
(24 0 

	

cn 1, 	o 	1.4 0 
0 	a) 

	

0 o 	c) 	 0 
a)  

	

as 	
bn -4•J 	k 

4-1 0 	
4-4 
0 

6 .4 	c4 
p4 k 

V) 	 (/) 	CU 	4-J 	 (4-4 

1-4 	CI 	 N 	
w 	0 
Q 	Cl) 0 	0 	

4 ra 	0 
co 	 '-c-n-i 	a) 

a) 

rd 
a) 	''' 	q  

k 	 0 . 
0 	 ' 

(') 	

0 	 CI-4 	Pi 
›,d 	0 0 

ci) 	ro 

(1) 

0 

0 

0 

fitrW, T111-411 13-01 11-ft(5-9 TITTITA, -Pfull;ft g.R1 9al#E1 	TIM-az!, '0410 -TO "ff2TT "Sr+-Ilt-d-2016. 



TM 4 ( 11) 	 TRIBT- r TR1451, fR1ëE 15 kffrAT 2017 	 659 

( "Ti ) 

fqzrcr 

Mil.  AT "NITA. .WITI rTTTI 

	

f----qtW 9/10 -9-41 	2017 

7T.T.4598-2017-. 44)114-*4-Nch 	TWI'514   31114-1-911TT, 1958 (sbi-lich 19 ill\  1958) "Wl' 
NM 23, #1?-4-(9.  1fcb4E ikciT, 1908 (1908 411 5) Ctil %TM 139 t TIM icif-d-ff 41U 122 "alt1 	-cirwrif TitaT, 1973 
(1974 1 2) t %TM 477 giti tT ffth-T4 T\r Rzffil- 	diaQ,, Tram-kw, 	JZ 	Trwi Tlkli 47 1,4 3T-T-k9.  
mekgRi, 	311-1-"Wi rILiH, 1976 -4 1i1Rfaft.1-1f 	T.Rthtri Wcart, 

Tittn- 
dcicf fizp# 

	

1. 	rizrii 4 1,  314-11RirT (1) -4, 	"Liirl -44" t 1:21Ti TET, 	qtf" wiftra.  f*-7 %41Q 

	

2. 	fizm 7 -44,— 

(1) -T4-f-1,4 4 1 (2) 14, .4, 	 .Prri 	"iorc-f" wftra 

(2) -Scr-itzfri (2) t-  "cR91-q„ Thl-lf-OfT§TU Z14-f-9741::( ‘31)1 ,Ak 31'24— 

" (2) "att-fl (2) 	3RJTTTird P-zn w4TFITt117T 	 airera .41 Wc12•1 	f4c-if 

	

3T-1 -qt 	-(1-1t(q A.  30 fq-i 	INR 	-t11111e9-1 	W-R9' 3Tta 3ITV 	 '471. 3i-cto .61 

	

Trifqf t , 	 -411164 fci 	v fc;R 11F 	c -mg 311scRi. 	qqiur---EN 	-1-41,:mur 
R-R 3Trkvr Trkrn..". 

3. fiTITT 9 -4, app. 2IT atT "T.15.00" t" T-2TH 17, 3TUT 2.TT 34-T "T.25.00" Wrcid .ftTit 

• F.No.4598-2017-XXI-B (1).—In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 73 of Madhya Pradesh Civil 
Courts Act, 1958 (No. 19 of 1958) Section 122 read with Section 139 of the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (No. 
5 of 1908) and Section 477 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (No. 2 of 1974), the High Court of Madhya 
Pradesh, with the prior approval of the State Government, hereby, makes following further amendments in the 
Commissioner of Oaths Rules, 1976, namely:-- 

AMENDMENTS 

In the said rules,- 

	

1. 	In rule 4, in sub--rule (1), for words "five years" , the words " three years" shall be substituted. 

	

2. 	In rule 7,— 

(1) in sub-rule (2), in the proviso, for the words "thirty days", the words "sixty days" 
shall be substituted. 

(2) after sub-rule (2), following sub-rule shall be added, namely.— 

"(2a) Any Commissioner of Oaths aggrieved by the order of District Judge passed under 
sub-rule (2) may prefer an appeal before the High Court within 30 days from the date of 
order of District Judge. On receipt of appeal, the High Court may condone the delay and 
order for renewal of certificate of Commissioner of Oaths.". 

3. In rule 9, for letters and figure "Rs, 15.00". the letters and figure "Rs. 25.00", shall he 
substituted, 

	

Irartft,T 	I 	114-1 	I1 311t11T4tt, 

Idtis fl chi) 'Tr, 3f-d-fri 111-44. 



660 
	

.ritzt9trf 	f"<*9--1W 15 fq-TF4t 2017 	 [ ITT ( 

d.cci kpiiqftlq, 

No.A-2885 	
Jabalpur, the 6th December 2017 

Annexure-A 

Rules: - 	The High Court of Madhya Pradesh Rules, 2008. 

1. In sub-rule (2) of rule 11 of Chapter XV, the following paragraph shall 
be inserted between the words "Dealing Assistant" and "shall submit", 

namely:- 
"after tracking the postal consignment on official website of India Post, 
Ministry of Communications, Government of India, 

(www.indiapost.gov.in) as per available status on aforesaid website". 

2. After sub-rule (2) of rule 11 of Chapter XV, sub-rule 3 shall be added as 

under:- 
"(3) In case after tracking the postal consignment on official website of 
India Post, Ministry of Communications, Government of India, 

(www.indiapost.gov.in), if status is "the service is not possible" or "it 
cannot be served due to some reason" then Deputy Registrar (Judicial) 

shall certify accordingly". 

3. "in Annexure (Chapter X, rule 1(9)) the words "Subject Category Code 
17253" relating to "Service relating to former High Court Judge & 
former Lokayukta" shall be substituted by "Subject Category Code No. 
17258" which was published in Gazette Notification dated 18-09-2017" 

Annexure-B 

Amendments  

Nomenclature: - The Gender Sensitisation and Sexual Harassment of Women at 
the High Court of Madhya Pradesh and its Subordinate Courts 
(Prevention, Prohibition and Redressal) Regulations, 2015. 

1, The words "Approved Draft" in the beginning of the sentence "The Gender 
Sensitisation and Sexual Harassment of Women at the High Court of 
Madhya Pradesh and Subordinate Courts (Prevention, Prohibition and 
Redressal) Regulations, 2015" shall be deleted. 

2. the words "Draft 16-02-2015" and the sentence "The Gender Sensitisation 
and Sexual Harassment of Women at the High Court of Madhya Pradesh and 
its Subordinate Courts (Prevention, Prohibition and Redressal) Regulations, 
2015" shall be deleted before para 

1St  starting from "whereas gender 

discrimination". 



•••••••••••••.... 	 •• 	• 

11111 4 (TI) 	 IzigkT 	11 -11,t) 15 fq-17zg 2017 	 661 

3. The following shall be added before para I St 
 starting from "whereas, gender 

discrimination" namely: 

Contents 
SL.No. 
.  

PARTICULARS 

...._ 
Page 
No. 

1.  Preamble 1-4 
2. Chapter-] 

Preliminary 
1. 	Short title, Extent and Commencement. 4 
2. 	Definitions. 4 
3. 	Prevention of Sexual Harassment. 9 

3. Chapter-II 
Composition & Constitution of GSICC, Term of Officeiand their 
Functions. 
4. 	Composition & Constitution of GSICC 10 
5. 	Term of office of Members of GSICC. 13 
6. 	Meeting of GSICC and procedure. 14 
7. 	Functions of the GSICC. 15 

4. Chapter-III 
Complaint & Inquiry 
8. 	Complaint of Sexual Harassment. 19 
9. 	Inquiry into Complaint. 20 
10. 	Inquiry Report. 21 
11. 	Orders on Jnquiry Report. 22 
12. 	Representation. 25 
	_ 	.. 13. 	Restraint Order. 26 
5. Chapter-TV 27 

Powers & Duties 
14. 	Power of GSICC and Internal Sub-Committee. 27 
15. 	Duties. 28 

6. Chapter-V 30 

4. In clause (a) of regulation 2 of chapter-I, the following paragraph shall be 
deleted after the words "precincts", namely:- 

"but does not include any female who is already governed by the Madhya 
Pradesh High Court service rules on the subject or Madhya Pradesh Civil 
Services (Conduct) Rules, 1965". 

5. In clause (2) of regulation 4 of chapter-IT, the words "4(2) (f)" shall be 
substituted by the words "4(1) (a) or (b), as the case may be,". 



662 	 titzPAT 1,.4147T, vokt) 15 .k-fIT'W 2017 	 [ I1P1 4 (11).  

6. And at the end of regulation under the heading of "THE SCHEDULE FEES 
OR ALLOWANCES OF OUTSIDE MEMBER", the words "4(2) (f)" shall 
be substituted by the words "4(1) (a) or (b), as the case may be,". 

7. In clause (d) of regulation 15 of Chapter-IV, the word "in" shall be added 
between the words "work" and "the". The word "precincts of' shall be 
added between the words "the" and "High Court". 

8. In clause (h) of regulation 15 of chapter-IV, the following sentence shalt be • 
inserted before the words "Cause to initiate" namely:- . 
"Where GSICC and Internal Sub-Committee, as the case may be, arrives at 
the conclusion that the allegation against the respondent has been proved, it 
shall recommend to the employer or District Judge or Registrar General, as 
the case may be- (i) to take action for sexual harassment as a misconduct in 
accordance with the provisions of the service rules applicable to the 
respondent and/or" 

Annexure-C 

Amendments 

Rules: -The High Court of Madhya Pradesh Digitization of Record Rules, 2014. 

After Rule 6) of Chapter —III, following shall be added, namely:- 

“7).  Notwithstanding anything contained in these Rules, all documents, other than 
those required to be preserved in perpetuity in accordance with the High Court of 
Madhya Pradesh Rules, 2008, may be eliminated after being retained and secured 
in electronic form and after certification as required by sub-section (4) of section 
65-8 of the Indian Evidence Act, 1872”. 

After Rule 1(d) of Chapter —IV, following shall be added, namely: 

“e. 	Notwithstanding anything contained in these Rules, all documents, other than 
those required to be preserved in perpetuity in accordance with the High Court of 
Madhya Pradesh Rules, 2008, may be eliminated after being retained and secured 
in electronic form and after certification as required by sub-section (4) of section 
65-B of the Indian Evidence Act, 1872". 

MOHD. FAHIM ANWAR, Registrar General. 

1-1LPIch,IftL44 VuT m 	 VTgtql gla 111-Ic4, 	 VvIltiLl, INTO -A -go -atrf mt4,151cf-2017. 


	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	00000006
	00000007
	00000008
	00000009
	00000010
	00000011
	00000012
	00000013
	00000014
	00000015
	00000016
	00000017
	00000018
	00000019
	00000020
	00000021
	00000022
	00000023
	00000024
	00000025
	00000026
	00000027
	00000028
	00000029
	00000030
	00000031
	00000032
	00000033
	00000034
	00000035
	00000036
	00000037
	00000038



